Articlel

Article 2

Article3

Article4

Article5

Article6

Article7

Article 8

Article9

Article 10

CHAPTER 18

Building Regulations

Building Code

Sec. 18-1-10 Adoption

Sec. 18-1-20 Copy on file

Sec. 18-1-30 Amendments
Sec. 18-1-40 Violations; penalties
Residential Code

Sec. 18-2-10 Adoption

Sec. 18-2-20 Copy on file

Sec. 18-2-30 Amendments
Electrical Code

Sec. 18-3-10 Adoption

Sec. 18-3-20 Copy on file

Sec. 18-3-30 Amendments

M echanical Code

Sec. 18-4-10 Adoption

Sec. 18-4-20 Copy on file

Sec. 18-4-30 Amendments
Plumbing Code

Sec. 18-5-10 Adoption

Sec. 18-5-20 Copy on file

Sec. 18-5-30 Amendments
Sec. 18-5-40 Town specifications
Fire Code

Sec. 18-6-10 Adoption

Sec. 18-6-20 Copy on file

Sec. 18-6-30 Amendments
Sec. 18-6-40 Violations; penalties
Fuel GasCode

Sec. 18-7-10 Adoption

Sec. 18-7-20 Copy on file

Sec. 18-7-30 Amendments
Energy Conservation Code

Sec. 18-8-10 Adoption

Sec. 18-8-20 Copy on file

Sec. 18-8-30 Amendments
Sec. 18-8-40 Violation; penalty
Property Maintenance Code

Sec. 18-9-10 Adoption

Sec. 18-9-20 Copy on file

Sec. 18-9-30 Amendments
Building Per mits

Sec. 18-10-10 Title and authority
Sec. 18-10-20  Building permit required

18-1



Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.
Sec.

18-10-30
18-10-40
18-10-50
18-10-60
18-10-70
18-10-80
18-10-90
18-10-100
18-10-110

Application; fees

Application of zoning map; interptieta
Review and decision procedure
Inspections

Cease and desist order; enforcement
Certificate of occupancy

Special use permit

Noncompliance

Expiration and renewal

18-2



ARTICLE 1
Building Code
Sec. 18-1-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.8ere is adopted as the building code of the Town,
by reference thereto, the International Buildingl€02006 edition, as published by the International
Code Council, Inc., 5360 South Workman Mill Roadhiter, California, 90601, Chapters 1 through
35 inclusive, Appendix | and Appendix J, to have same force and effect as if fully set forth harei
with the additions, deletions, insertions and clesngs set forth in Section 18-1-30 below. The
subject matter of the adopted code includes corngmstre provisions and standards regulating the
erection, construction, enlargement, alteratiorpaire moving, removal, conversion, demolition,
occupancy, equipment, use, height, area and maimtenof buildings and structures for the purpose
of protecting the public health, safety and genemfare. (Ord. 1997-7 81; Ord. 2011-2 81, Ord.
2011-18 81)

Sec. 18-1-20. Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the International Buildi@gde adopted herein, certified to be a true copy,
has been and is now on file in the office of thevmoClerk or Building Inspector and may be
inspected by any interested person between thesladu8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through
Friday, holidays excepted. The code as finallypaeld shall be available for sale to the public
through the office of the Town Clerk at a modernatiee. (Ord. 1997-7 §3; Ord. 2011-2 §2; Ord.
2011-18 81)

Sec. 18-1-30. Amendments.
The code adopted herein is hereby modified byaleviing amendments:

(1) Deletion and substitution (Applicability), Sext 102.6, Existing structures. Delete
Section 102.6 in its entirety and substitute tHiofang:

"The legal occupancy of any structure existing lwadate of adoption of this code shall be
permitted to continue without change unless theongbe type of occupancy of the structure is
changed. If the use or occupancy changes, théibgiwill only be required to meet the
minimum requirements of the new occupancy class."

(2) Deletion (Department of Building Safety), Seatil03.3, Deputies. Delete Section 103.3,
the following:

"For the maintenance of existing properties, sex Ithernational Property Maintenance
Code."

(3) Deletion and substitution (Fees), Section 108c¢hedule of permit fees. Delete Section
108.2 in its entirety and substitute the following:

"On buildings, structures, structural remodelsalterations requiring a permit, a fee for
each permit shall be paid as required and shadlalsed on the square footage construction cost

18-3



table as illustrated in the Building Safety Journaligust 2005 edition (to be updated as
necessary for market cost fluctuation), attache@theand the 2006 International Residential
Code Appendix L — Permit Fees, attached heretonuAhpermit fees are established by the
building official."

(4) Deletion and substitution (Fees), Section 1088ilding permit valuations. Delete
Section 108.3 in its entirety and substitute tHvang:

"The valuation for the permit is established in@dance with the Building Safety Journal,
August 2005 edition — Square Foot Construction €dstble (to be updated as necessary for
market cost variation), attached hereto."

(5) Deletion and substitution (Inspections), Secti®9. Delete Section 109 in its entirety and
substitute the following:

"109.1 General. All construction or work for which a permit isquired shall be subject to
inspection by the building official and all suchnstruction or work shall remain accessible
and exposed for inspection purposes until apprdwedhe building official. In addition,
certain types of construction shall have continuaspection.

"Approval as a result of an inspection shall notcdoastrued to be an approval of a
violation of the provisions of this code or of atherdinances of the jurisdiction.
Inspections presuming to give authority to violatecancel the provisions of this code or of
other ordinances of the jurisdiction shall not laéd:

"It shall be the duty of the permit applicant tasa the work to remain accessible and
exposed for inspection purposes. Neither the mgjldfficial nor the jurisdiction shall be

liable for expense entailed in the removal or re@haent of any material required to allow
inspection.

"A survey of the lot may be required by the buitglimficial to verify that the structure is
located in accordance with the approved plans.

"109.2 Inspection Record Card. Work requiring a permit shall not be commenceadlu
the permit holder or an agent of the permit holdeall have posted or otherwise made
available an inspection record card such as tavathe building official to conveniently make
the required entries thereon regarding inspectiothe work. This card shall be maintained
available by the permit holder until final approtals been granted by the building official.

"109.3 Inspection Requests. It shall be the duty of the person doing the knauthorized
by a permit to notify the building official that gluwork is ready for inspection. The building
official may require that every request for inspatibe filed at least two working days before
such inspection is desired. Such request may kbeiiimg or by telephone at the option of the
building official.

"It shall be the duty of the person requesting argpections required by this code to
provide access to and means for inspection of sk,

18-4



"109.4 Approval Required. Work shall not be done beyond the point indidate each
successive inspection without first obtaining theraval of the building official. The building
official, upon natification, shall make the requegstinspections and shall either indicate that
portion of the construction is satisfactory as ctatga, or shall notify the permit holder or an
agent of the permit holder wherein the same failsamply with this code. Any portions that
do not comply shall be corrected and such portioall not be covered or concealed until
authorized by the building official.

"There shall be a final inspection and approvalabbfbuildings and structures when
completed and ready for occupancy and use.

"109.5 Required I nspections.

"109.5.1 General. Reinforcing and steel or structural frameworkaofy part of any
building or structure shall not be covered or catea without first obtaining the approval
of the building official.

"Protection of joints and penetrations in fire-stisie assemblies shall not be
concealed from view until inspected and approved.

"The building official, upon notification, shall rka the inspections set forth in the
following sections.

"109.5.2 Footing/monalithic and structural pad inspection. To be made after
excavations for footings and pads are completeaagdequired reinforcing steel is in place
and before placement of concrete.

"109.5.3 Foundation wall inspection. For concrete foundations, any required forms
and required reinforcing steel shall be in placerpio inspection. All materials for the
foundation shall be on the job; except where cdecie ready mixed in accordance with
approved nationally recognized standards, the ebmareed not be on the job. Where the
foundation wall is to be constructed of approveshted wood, additional inspections may
be required by the building official.

"Concrete slab or under-floor inspection. To belenafter all in-slab or under-floor
building service equipment, conduit, piping accessoand other ancillary equipment
items are in place, but before any concrete iseolaor floor sheathing installed,
including the sub floor.

"109.5.5 Sheathing inspection. To be made after exterior walls and roof hasnbee
sheathed and before any covering is placed overah@atterns.

"109.5.6 Frame ingpection. To be made after the roof, all framing, fire ddmg and

bracing are in place and all pipes, chimneys amtsvare complete and the rough electrical,
plumbing, and heating wires, pipes and ducts apecapd.

18-5



"109.5.7 Lath or gypsum board inspection. To be made after all lathing and gypsum
board, interior and exterior, is in place, but befany plastering is applied or before
gypsum board joints and fasteners are taped aisthéid.

"109.5.8 Mid-roof inspection. To be made after ice and water shield, valley
underlayment and flashing placement, but before simyngles or metal roof material
installment.

"109.5.9 Fire rated drywall inspection. To be made after th&" drywall for fire
protection has been installed, but before any tapirplaster application.

"109.5.10 Final inspection. To be made after finish grading and the buildiag
completed and ready for occupancy.

"109.6 Other inspections. In addition to the called inspections specifigioove, the
building official may make or require other inspens of any construction work to ascertain
compliance with the provisions of this code andeottaws which are enforced by the code
enforcement agency."

(6) Addition (Inspections), Section 109.7, Reindjmars. Add Section 109.7, Reinspections:

"A reinspection fee may be assessed for each itispemr reinspection when such portion
of work for which inspection is called is not comi@ or when corrections called for are not
made.

"This section is not to be interpreted as requir@igspection fees the first time a job is
rejected for failure to comply with the requireneemf this code, but as controlling the
practice of calling for inspections before the jplbeady for such inspection or reinspection.

"Reinspection fees may be assessed when the ifmpeetord card is not posted or
otherwise available on the work site, the appropkhs are not readily available to the

inspector, for failure to provide access on thedat which inspection is requested, or for
deviating from plans requiring the approval of tudlding official.

"To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall &le application therefor in writing on a
form furnished for that purpose and pay the reiospe fee in accordance with the fee
established by the building official.

"In instances where reinspection fees have beassesd, no additional inspection of the
work will be preformed until the required fees h&e=n paid."

(7) Deletion and substitution (Board of Appeal)c&mn 112.1, General. Delete Section 112.1
the following:

"There shall be and is hereby created a boardpéalp.”
And substitute the following:

"There shall be a board of appeals created whesseary."

18-6



(8) Deletion and substitution (Definitions), Seati®02.1, HEIGHT, BUILDING. Delete
Section 502.1, HEIGHT BUILDING, in its entirety asdbstitute the following:

"The vertical distance above a reference datum unedgo the highest point of the coping
of a flat roof or to the deck line of a mansardfrooto the average height of the highest gable
of a pitched or hipped roof. The reference dathail e selected by either of the following,
whichever yields a greater height of building:

"a. The elevation of the highest adjoining sidéwai ground surface within a 5-foot
(1524 mm) horizontal distance of the exterior vadlithe building when such sidewalk or
ground surface is not more than 10 feet (3048 nbayea highest grade.

"b. An elevation 10 feet (3048 mm) higher than liheest grade when the sidewalk or
ground surface described in Item 1 is more thafe&0(3048 mm) above lowest grade.

"The height of a stepped or terraced building s teximum height of any segment of the
building."

(Ord. 2011-2 83; Ord. 2011-18 81)
Sec. 18-1-40. Violations; penalties.

It is unlawful for any person, including an owneccupant or builder, to erect, construct, enlarge,
alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert omdksh, equip, use, occupy or maintain any
building or structure in the Town, or cause the eambe done, contrary to or in violation of any of
the provision of the International Building Cod@ violation of any of the provisions of the code
shall constitute a misdemeanor offense punishapten iconviction by a fine not to exceed one
thousand ($1,000.00) or by imprisonment not to esdcene (1) year, or by both such fine and
imprisonment, for each separate offense. A sepafftnse shall be deemed committed on each day,
or portion thereof, that the violation of any oétprovisions of the code occurs or continues ureabat
after the time limit set for abatement of the vima. (Ord. 1997-7 §2; Ord. 2011-2 §4; Ord. 20B1-1
81)

ARTICLE 2
Residential Code

Sec. 18-2-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.8gre is adopted as the residential code of the
Town, by reference thereto, the International Radidl Code, 2006 edition, together with all
appendices and tables thereto, published by thernational Code Council, Inc., 5360 South
Workman Mill Road, Whittier, California, to haveelsame force and effect as if set forth herein in
every particular. The subject matter of the adbptede includes comprehensive provisions and
standards regulating the erection, constructiomargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal,
conversion, demolition, occupancy, equipment, height, area and maintenance of buildings and

18-7



structures for the purpose of protecting the pubéalth, safety and general welfare. (Ord. 2011-18
81)

Sec. 18-2-20. Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the International Resid@r€ode, certified to be a true copy, has been
and is now on file in the office of the Town Cleskd may be inspected by any interested person
between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Mptid@ugh Friday, holidays excepted. The code
as finally adopted shall be available for saleh® public through the office of the Town Clerk at a
moderate price. (Ord. 2011-18 81)

Sec. 18-2-30. Amendments.

The code adopted herein is hereby modified by tewiing amendments: none. (Ord. 2011-18
81)

ARTICLE 3
Electrical Code
Sec. 18-3-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.8ert is adopted as the electrical code of the Town,
by reference thereto, the National Electrical Co#@)8 edition, and all appendices, tables and
examples thereto, published by the National Figdetion Association, Batterymarch Park, Quincy,
MA 02269. The purpose of the adopted code is ¢tept the health, safety and lives of the residents
of the Town. The subject matter of the adoptededodludes comprehensive rules and regulations
governing materials, methods of installation, irtjp& and other matters pertaining to the practical
safeguarding of persons and property from hazaigim@ from the use of electricity. (Ord. 2011-18
81)

Sec. 18-3-20. Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the National Electricaldépcertified to be a true copy, has been and is
now on file in the office of the Town Clerk and mbg inspected by any interested person between
the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday thindtigday, holidays excepted. The code as finally
adopted shall be available for sale to the pulbliough the office of the Town Clerk at a moderate
price. (Ord. 2011-18 8§1)

Sec. 18-3-30. Amendments.

The code adopted herein is hereby modified by thewiing amendments: none. (Ord. 2011-18
81)

18-8



ARTICLE 4
M echanical Code
Sec. 18-4-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.8ert is adopted as the mechanical code for the
Town, by reference thereto, the International Medata&l Code, 2006 edition, together with all
appendices and tables thereto, published by thernitional Code Council, Inc., 5360 South
Workman Mill Road, Whittier, California. The subjematter of the adopted code includes
comprehensive provisions and standards relatingh&o erection, installation, alteration, repair,
relocation, replacement, addition to, use or masmee of heating, ventilating, cooling and
refrigeration systems, incinerators or other misoglous heat-producing appliances within the Town
for the purpose of protecting the public healtlietsaand general welfare. (Ord. 2011-18 §1)

Sec. 18-4-20. Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the International MechahiCode, certified to be a true copy, has been
and is now on file in the office of the Town Cleskd may be inspected by any interested person
between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Mptidk@ugh Friday, holidays excepted. The code
as finally adopted shall be available for saleh® public through the office of the Town Clerk at a
moderate price. (Ord. 2011-18 §1)

Sec. 18-4-30. Amendments.
The code adopted herein is hereby modified by ¢ewwing amendments: none. (Ord. 2011-18
81)

ARTICLE 5
Plumbing Code
Sec. 18-5-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.Bert is adopted as the plumbing code of the Town,
by reference thereto, the International Plumbingl€;@®2006 edition, and all appendices and tables
thereto, published by the International Associatioh Plumbing and Mechanical Officials,
headquarters at 5032 Alhambra Avenue, Los Ang€labfornia. The subject matter of the adopted
code includes comprehensive regulations governiatgrnals, installation methods and other matters
pertaining to plumbing for the purpose of protegtihe public health, safety and general welfare.
(Ord. 2011-18 81)

Sec. 18-5-20. Copy on file.
At least one (1) copy of the International Plumb{gde, certified to be a true copy, has been and

is now on file in the office of the Town Clerk anthy be inspected by an interested person between
the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday thindtigday, holidays excepted. The code as finally

18-9



adopted shall be available for sale to the puliiiough the office of the Town Clerk at a moderate
price. (Ord. 2011-18 81)

Sec. 18-5-30. Amendments.

The code adopted herein is hereby modified by elieviing amendments: none. (Ord. 2011-18
81)

Sec. 18-5-40. Town specifications.

There is hereby adopted by reference thereto thenBoWater and Sanitary Sewer System
Specifications, as amended. The subject mattéreoSpecifications includes regulations governing
installation and maintenance pertaining to plumbwithin the Town. A copy of the Water and
Sanitary Sewer System Specifications is now ontlildne Town Clerk's office. (Ord. 2011-18 81)

ARTICLE 6
Fire Code

Sec. 18-6-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.8ert is adopted as the fire code for the Town, by
reference thereto, the International Fire Code,6268@ition, and all appendices and tables thereto,
published by the International Code Council, Irand the Western Fire Chiefs Association, 5360
South Workman Mill Road, Whittier, California, 90b0 The subject matter of the adopted code
includes comprehensive provisions and standardgyrdss to prevent fires. The purpose of the
adopted code is to protect the health, safety aglthve of the residents of the Town. (Ord. 2003-1
81; Ord. 2011-18 81)

Sec. 18-6-20. Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the International Fire €Ea@dlopted herein, certified to be a true copy, has
been and is now on file in the office of the Towler&® and may be inspected by any interested person
between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Mptldk@ugh Friday, holidays excepted. The code
as finally adopted shall be available for saleh® public through the office of the Town Clerk at a
moderate price. (Ord. 2003-1 §1; Ord. 2011-18 81)

Sec. 18-6-30. Amendments.
The code adopted herein and its appendices aredmohexs follows: none. (Ord. 2011-18 8§1)
Sec. 18-6-40. Violations; penalties.

It is unlawful for any person, including an owneccupant or builder, to erect, construct, enlarge,
alter, repair, move, improve, remove, convert omdkésh, equip, use, occupy or maintain any
building or structure in the Town, or cause the eambe done, contrary to or in violation of any of
the provisions of the International Fire Code. i8lation of any of the provisions of the code shall
constitute a misdemeanor offense, punishable upariction in accordance with the provisions of

18-10



Section 1-4-20 of this Code. A separate offensdl e deemed committed on each day, or portion
thereof, that the violation of any of the provisioof the Code or this Article occurs or continues
unabated after the time limit set for abatemerhefviolation. (Ord. 2003-1 82; Ord. 2011-18 81)

ARTICLE 7
Fuel Gas Code
Sec. 18-7-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, C.R.S., therdné&eby adopted the 2006 International Fuel Gas
Code, published by the International Code Coud€if1l West Flossmoor Road, Country Club Hills,
lllinois, 60478-5795. The purpose of the Interoaél Fuel Gas Code is to provide minimum
standards to safeguard life or limb, health, priypand public welfare by regulating and controlling
the design, construction, quality of materials, agd occupancy, location and maintenance of fuel
gas piping systems and fuel gas utilization equigmeithin the Town and related accessories
specifically regulated in the International FuelksGzode. (Ord. 2011-18 §1)

Sec. 18-7-20. Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the International Fuel @asle, certified to be a true copy, has been and
is now on file in the office of the Town Clerk anty be inspected by any interested person between
the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday thindtigday, holidays excepted. The code as finally
adopted shall be available for sale to the puliiiough the office of the Town Clerk at a moderate
price. (Ord. 2011-18 81)

Sec. 18-7-30. Amendments.

The code adopted herein is hereby modified by elieviing amendments: none. (Ord. 2011-18
81)

ARTICLE 8
Energy Conservation Code
Sec. 18-8-10. Adoption.

(a) The International Energy Conservation Code 92B4dition, including the outline of contents,
index and appendixes contained therein, publishedhb International Code Council, 500 New
Jersey Avenue, NW 6th Floor, Washington, DC, 20@®hereby adopted.

(b) The provisions of the International Energy Gawmation Code, 2009 Edition, shall apply to

the construction of, and renovations or additiansatl commercial and residential buildings within
the Town. (Ord. 2008-5 §1; Ord. 2011-18 81)

18-11



Sec. 18-8-20. Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the International Energyn€ervation Code, certified to be a true copy,
has been and is now on file in the office of thevmoClerk or Building Inspector and may be
inspected by any interested person between thestadu8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through
Friday, holidays excepted. The code as finallypaeld shall be available for sale to the public
through the office of the Town Clerk at a modegaiee. (Ord. 2008-5 82; Ord. 2011-18 81)

Sec. 18-8-30. Amendments.

The International Energy Conservation Code as adojit this Article shall be amended as
follows:

(1) Deletions. The following sections, subsecti@amsl tables of the International Energy
Conservation Code are hereby deleted: 101.4.448)1101.5.2; 102.1.1; 102.1.2; 102.1.3; Table
102.1.3(1); Table 102.1.3(2); Table 102.1.3(3); .1(3 104; 105; 107; 401.2; 401.3; 402.1;
402.1.1; 402.1.2; 402.1.3, together with exceptibn® and 3; 402.2.2.3, together with exceptions
1, 2 and 3; 402.2.4; Table 402.2.4; 402.2.6; 402.202.2.8; 402.2.9; 402.2.10; 402.3; 402.3.1;
402.3.2; 402.3.3; 402.3.4; 402.3.5; 402.3.6; 40202.1, including subparagraphs 1 through 10,
inclusive; 402.4.2, including all exceptions; 4Q3,4including subparagraphs 1, 2 and 3; 402.5,
including exceptions 1, 2 and 3; 402.6; 403; andl 40

(2) Additions.
a. A new Section 303 is hereby added to read &sisl

"SECTION 303
PARK COUNTY CLIMATE ZONE

"303.1 Park County Climate Zone. In recognition of local weather conditions, ahd t
provision of this Chapter notwithstanding, as tbrasidential construction, Park County
shall be considered Climate Zone 5."

b. Footnote f. is added to the entire "Ceiling Rt column contained in Table 402.1.1.

c. A new footnote h. is added to the entire "CgilR-Value" Column contained in Table
402.1.1, to read as follows:

"Baffles shall be provided against the undersidemof sheathing to facilitate ventilation
above exterior walls on trussed roofs and entigdsravhen framing members supporting
both the roof and ceilings are less than 14 indeep. All such baffles shall be a minimum
of 1 inch deep."

(Ord. 2008-5 83; Ord. 2011-18 81)
Sec. 18-8-40. Violation; penalty.

Violations of the International Energy Conservatidade adopted herein shall be punished by a
fine not to exceed one thousand dollars ($1,000.00jd. 2008-5 §1; Ord. 2011-18 81)

18-12



ARTICLE9
Property Maintenance Code
Sec. 18-9-10. Adoption.

Pursuant to Title 31, Article 16, Part 2, C.R.8ert is adopted as the mechanical code for the
Town, by reference thereto, the International Priydaintenance Code, 2006 edition, together with
all appendices and tables thereto, published bylrnternational Code Council, Inc., 5360 South
Workman Mill Road, Whittier, California. The subjematter of the adopted code includes minimum
requirements and standards for premises, structeggpment and facilities for light, ventilation,
space, heating, sanitation, protection from thenelds, life safety, safety from fire and other hdga
and for safe and sanitary maintenance; for the qa&rf protecting the public health, safety and
general welfare within the Town. (Ord. 1989 §1d(#011-18 81)

Sec. 18-9-20. Copy on file.

At least one (1) copy of the UCADB, certified to @¢rue copy, has been and is now on file in the
office of the Town Clerk and may be inspected by eaterested person between the hours of 8:00
a.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday, holideysepted. The code as finally adopted shall be
available for sale to the public through the offadehe Town Clerk at a moderate price. (Ord. 2011
18 81)

Sec. 18-9-30. Amendments.

The code adopted herein is hereby modified by ¢ewwing amendments: none. (Ord. 2011-18
81)

ARTICLE 10
Building Permits
Sec. 18-10-10. Titleand authority.

(@) There is hereby established the position ofdihg Inspector. It shall be the duty of the
Building Inspector to enforce the provisions ofstliirticle. In the absence of a Building Inspector,
enforcement shall be the responsibility of eitiexr Town Planner or the Mayor, at the direction of
the Board of Trustees.

(b) No oversight or dereliction on the part of Bwilding Inspector or on the part of any official
or employee of the Town shall legalize, authoriz@xcuse the violation of any of the provisions of
this Section. (Ord. 1981-1 §1; Ord. 2011-18 81)

Sec. 18-10-20. Building permit required.

(@) A building permit shall be required for any neanstruction or change of the use on vacant
land within the Town.

18-13



(b) It shall be unlawful to erect, construct, restoact, structurally alter or change the use of any
building or other structure without first obtainiragn approved building permit from the Board of
Trustees.

(c) It shall be unlawful to change the use of aagant land, except for agricultural purposes,
without first obtaining a special use permit frome tBoard of Trustees (see Section 18-10-90 of this
Article). (Ord. 1981-1 81; Ord. 2011-18 81)

Sec. 18-10-30. Application; fees.

(@) Application for a building permit shall be madith the Town Planner. With the application,
the applicant must supply a legal description lhar property on which the structure is to be located
detailed sketch showing the exact location of tlt@ppsed structure or improvement with respect to
existing monumentation of the property boundareeg)lan and elevation views of the proposed
structure or improvement detailing the type of d¢anrdion (frame, masonry, modular, etc.),
approximate square footage and the intended uses.

(b) The fee for the building permit will be directbroportional to the useable square footage of
the interior floor space, including closets, wilibpoms, etc. The fee schedule will be determimed
the Board of Trustees under a separate resoluticim that it shall be relative to the costs incuiogd
the Town for application processing and subseqguspections. The actual fee, per building permit,
shall be calculated by the Town Planner in accardamith the schedule established by the Board of
Trustees. (Ord. 1981-1 81; Ord. 2011-18 81)

Sec. 18-10-40. Application of zoning map; inter pretation.

Where uncertainty exists with respect to the botiedeof the various districts as shown on the
zoning map, the following rules shall apply:

(1) In subdivided areas, unless otherwise showthemaps, the district boundaries are either
streets or alleys of record, or lot lines.

(2) In unsubdivided areas, the district boundariesless otherwise shown, are streets,
highways or land survey lines of record.

(3) In the event of controversy regarding the lmrabf a district boundary line, the matter
shall be referred to the Board of Adjustment. (Q!@B1-1 81; Ord. 2011-18 8§1)

Sec. 18-10-50. Review and decision procedure.

(a) Approval for all building permits shall be mablg the Building Inspector. Preconditions to
approval are the following:

(1) Full payment of the building permit fee.

(2) Successful completion of the building permiplagation (see Section 18-10-30 above).

18-14



(3) A determination by the Building Inspector trsmtund design and construction methods
shall be used, to include any subsequent requiresnbat the Building Inspector may consider
necessary to ensure the health, safety and welfahe general public.

(4) Proof of payment of sewer and water tap feete@s exempt under relevant public utility
regulations).

(5) Where a variance may be required to meet zorggglations, written proof that such
variance has been granted by the Board of Adjustmen

(b) It shall be the duty of the Building Inspectord/or the Town Planner to review the building
permit application.

(c) The Building Inspector, upon reviewing the abaviteria, may approve or deny the building
permit application. Satisfaction of the applicatiand of the other submission requirements by the
applicant allows a decision by the Building Inspecbut it does not in any manner guarantee tleat th
application will be approved. (Ord. 1981-1 81; Orf196-2 81; Ord. 2011-18 §1)

Sec. 18-10-60. Inspections.

(a) Site inspection. Site inspections shall bdgpaered by the Building Inspector or by the duly
appointed official of the Town under Section 184Mef this Article. Subject to the site inspection
are the following:

(1) Minimum setback requirements, as stipulatetha building permit application, shall be
met and inspected at the time of completion ofathiéding pad or foundation.

(2) Upon completion of the structure or improvemehe approved uses, square footage,
exterior appearance and any other attendant regeires set forth within the approved building
permit; i.e., landscaping, parking requirementsadrogrades, drainage and erosion control
measures, shall be met and inspected prior tonssuaf a certificate of occupancy.

(b) Building inspection. Building inspections, inding structural, electrical and plumbing, shall
be conducted at the discretion of the Board of fBes where special requirements have been set
forth in the approved building permit, or where thealth, safety and welfare of the general public
appears to have been jeopardized by unsound bgilgractice. Failure to comply with any
subsequent requirements set forth by the Boardustées as a result of a building inspection diall
considered noncompliance under Section 18-10-1@Wbe

(c) Utility inspections. As provided by separatedipance, a permit is required for the
excavation and installation of water and seweriserines within the Town. Such installation must
also be inspected by either the Water Superintdratethe Sewer Superintendent prior to issuance of
a certificate of occupancy by the Building Inspeaoother duly authorized official of the Town.

(d) Building codes as guides. In connection whth inspections described at Subsections (a), (b)

and (c) above, the Board of Trustees will use, amide, the versions of the following codes as
adopted by the Town in this Chapter:

18-15



(1) International Building Code;

(2) International Residential Code;

(3) National Electrical Code;

(4) International Mechanical Code;

(5) International Plumbing Code;

(6) International Fire Code;

(7) International Fuel Gas Code;

(8) International Energy Conservation Code; and

(9) International Property Maintenance Code. (@@81-1 81; Ord. 2011-18 §1)
Sec. 18-10-70. Cease and desist order; enfor cement.

To authorize or undertake the construction of amycture or improvement within the Town
without an approved building permit shall be coastdl noncompliance under Section 18-10-100
below. Whereby, upon notification from any officaa employee of the Town that a violation of this
Section exists, i.e., building without a permitsiitall be the responsibility of the owner of thejsat

property to cease and desist in all activitiedhatdite of construction. (Ord. 1981-1 §1; Ord. 208
81)

Sec. 18-10-80. Certificate of occupancy.

A certificate of occupancy shall be issued by thelding Inspector or by the duly appointed
official of the Town under Section 18-10-10 of tiisticle, upon successful completion of the site
and building and utility inspections, as applicablEailure to obtain a certificate of occupancy is
noncompliance under Section 18-10-100 below. (0881-1 §1; Ord. 2011-18 8§1)

Sec. 18-10-90. Special use permit.

(a) A special use permit shall be required for ahginge of use of vacant land other than for
agricultural purposes. Activities such as miniaguipment or materials storage or any commercial
activity shall require a special use permit.

(b) Application for a special use permit shall beada with the Town Planner. With the
application, the applicant must provide a legakdpsion for the property on which the activityts
take place, a detailed plan or outline of the tgpeactivity for which the application is being made
and a statement addressing any adverse affecisrdpesed activity may have on the surrounding
area.

(c) Approval for all special use permits must bedmdy a majority vote of the Board of

Trustees. Consideration for noise, pollution, catiglity with surrounding uses and the health,
safety and welfare of the general public shall bergto the application.

18-16



(d) Special use permits shall be issued on an armags only and must be renewed by a
majority vote of the Board of Trustees.

(e) Failure to comply with and the enforcementlo$ tSection shall fall under the authority of
Section 18-10-70 above. (Ord. 1981-1 §1; Ord. 204.81)

Sec. 18-10-100. Noncompliance.

Any noncompliance with the regulations set fortldemthis Article shall be subject to a fine not
greater than ten (10) times the amount of the mglgermit application fee, in addition to criminal
prosecution. In the event construction has ocduwithout an approved building permit, the Board
of Trustees shall estimate the useable squaregeaifthe structure or improvement and apply the
same penalty as above. Such fines assigned umeleuthority of this Article shall be construed a
special assessment and a lien against the subjeenty upon which the improvement has been
made. (Ord. 1981-1 8§1; Ord. 2011-18 81)

Sec. 18-10-110. Expiration and renewal.

Each building permit issued shall automaticallyiexpne (1) year after its date of issue. If no
substantial action has been undertaken pursuathiet@xpired building permit, the permittee must
apply for a new building permit in all respectsfabe expired building permit had never been issue
If substantial steps have been undertaken purgaahe expired building permit, the renewal of the
building permit may then be issued for a reasondbigth of time to permit completion of
construction. Upon failure of the permittee to pbate construction within the renewal period, the
permittee may apply for a second renewal. Upoluriiof the permittee to complete construction
and obtain a certificate of occupancy within theosel renewal period, the permittee may, at the
option of the Board of Trustees, either be grarftether renewals or be required to restore the
property to its original condition prior to issu@nef the original building permit. (Ord. 1982-6;81
Ord. 2011-18 81)

18-17



